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The Partners' aims are for a long-term sustainable and profitable business operating as a conduit 
providing digital and data opportunities to a diverse twenty-first century workforce and 
enabling local lifestyle opportunities.

 

The business is cantered around continuing the development of our capabilities with security by 
design in mind: physical; technology; process; information; and people, that enable 
our customers to accelerate the delivery of the capability that meets  their needs.


We know that the technical and customer expertise of the X-Net team is the key to establishing 
and sustaining long term commercial relationships; where customers not only experience the 
critical value they receive but importantly make the decision to continue their contracted services 
easily and problem-free. 


We will capitalise on our learnings from delivering 5G test infrastructure, BattleLab capability 
and our multi faceted engineering development capabilities to create our offering to accelerate the 
adoption of emerging technologies.

 
We understand that the success of our business depends on realising the potential of all members 
of our organisation and therefore we will equip people with the skills and technology that enables 
them to reach that potential. We commit to encourage equality, diversity and inclusion in our work 
force and to make it our mission to ensure each employee feels valued and appreciated in their 
job.


Our environmental efforts in previous years have been concentrated on advocating employee 
involvement in all environmental matters, minimising waste to lowest possible level, promoting the 
use of renewal and recyclable materials and investing in equipment that helps maintain a low 
carbon footprint. All these activities help to manage our carbon footprint and a goal for the 
upcoming year is to create a Carbon Reduction Plan that is aligned with the Government's Net 
Zero by 2030 Agenda.

 

We want to be recognised in terms of our credentials, achievements and values to compete with 
the larger suppliers, and accessible enough so that big suppliers simply can't compete.

  

We know first-hand how important it is to have a solid business base aligned to our social values. 
It is our ambition to continue to reuse our experience and apply them to new opportunities in 
order to continue to provide new technologies and interesting challenges for our workforce. 
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